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YRI Monday Webcast. Join Dr. Ed’s live Q&A webinar on Mondays at 11 a.m. EST. You 
will receive an email with the link to the webinar one hour before showtime. Replays of the 
Monday webinars are available here. 
  
Strategy I: So Far, So Good. The S&P 500 rose 4.0% last week and 2.5% just on Friday to 
close at 3901. It is up 9.1% since it bottomed at 3577 on a closing basis on October 12. If 
that was the bear market’s bottom, then it lasted 282 days (since the January 3 record high) 
and trimmed the index by 25.4% (Fig. 1 and Fig. 2). 
  
The index is now 18.7% below its January 3 record high of 4796. It jumped easily above its 
50-day moving average on Friday. It is likely to retest its 200-day moving average, which 
was 4098 on Friday. Joe and I are still expecting it to revisit its August 16 high of 4305 by 
the end of this year. The Santa Claus rally might have started already, and Santa’s sled is 
likely to be supercharged by the congressional midterm elections, as we first discussed in 
our October 19 Morning Briefing and explored further on October 24. 
  
The bear market in the S&P 500 has been entirely attributable to a 30% plunge in the S&P 
500’s forward P/E from 21.5 on January 3 to 15.1 on October 12 (Fig. 3). We continue to 
believe, as we’ve been writing, that the 15.0 level should hold as long as the economic 
outlook is for a soft landing rather than a hard one. The forward earnings of the S&P 500 
increased 4.6% since the first week of January through the third week of October (Fig. 4). 
This weekly proxy for earnings peaked during the June 23 week, falling 1.8% through the 
October 20 week. (FYI: “Forward P/E” is the multiple using “forward earnings,” which is the 

 
Check out the accompanying chart collection. 
  
Executive Summary: The bear market has clawed 30% out of stock valuations, returning the S&P 
500’s forward P/E to its historical average of 15. But October 12 may have marked the bear’s bottom. 
If GDP and inflation perform as we expect and the Fed does what everyone expects, that bottom 
should hold. … We think the stock market has discounted a soft-landing scenario (to which we give a 
60% subjective probability) but is nervous about a hard landing (40%). … Also: The MegaCap-8 
stocks’ outsized influence over their resident indexes has been diminished. … Movie review: “All Quiet 
on the Western Front” (+ + +). 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgNDnW1b3_Sg4vwXM_W3kCnPK6dZsHXW4Kjb8S8VHyZZW24hfvv3PCqytN4Nj6B4Fw6d7W46HFY469yXngMsjLCTGpZmdW11P8gq8V40vnW8rf50r3Sjw2NW3Y9Hfv6yDFdhN7y_BrvrQGtLW6rMfmf3-7FFJW6hZbfJ3KFs_GW2vH1fK1R4spMW7LYlFB2BL0-BW7F4rvm10dPzwW4ycxwq8gy4HFW7sxXpc3y9fxRW3D0v752B1KnwW3G6jK46GrQrzW6179TK7TPbZrW7K97yk7__wd13fRf1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgNFlW6lt5V-5x7WcfW8qPXS54c3yplVS6NgW4lnlwFN4njXxctDFqHW5nqlbf2Yg-PkW4z_8_p4r0cVFW7SgzjP8XpPdjW2WJmbs6vK0MKW3p99Rc5HCdc1MJ_8pYmsf9DW4QLm5j3P0XDPW1HpBxW4SNF0KN5fr70-Q1h9zW4zqkBy523qYyVh4NwD7dwls6W56HHdW5CyJj5W2S_qWj8Q55NpW7LBH4J72HK6WW7VpTSP1D819zN4j2C2LPkZqqW1w-lfq1RLsMPVFGYmc6rLHzw3kvd1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgDyxN7y-xqnHxBZgVBHb3_8DBgYLW6w2F7J3K_BRJW9l_9wZ43B_QdW6Prl2H7NB3vZMLjCG3sNMQBN19nZ3yn3VJ0W26DWq_2D80n1W2Rtv-41K-86dVHnFLd6R32wCW14BfBz8VBCr-W8QwB2g3m_vY7W7lcR_p8R22NdW2PzWN25fHbCrW1Mh22c22qz7qW7jv4s-4PFHDLVfBGLY4lxpWXW1W5HQJ8Ccx9dV-gY9h1ctPxsW6d3q2V3PdsnyN153p3g6jNTBW30D3QY5cr-kF3lMW1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-N3q905V1-WJV7CgScDW8sqjFL8dgV3bW7THb_Z1DGv53W50Xl3G5H7gLgW2gmQF63qbmvLW5wbbZK84fh7YW1V9xXR1mVNykW44r4yK7Rx9ZSW2GcXHK45jGH2W7_y19H6PYD3YVSvcvG6plS7MW3BdlNx2d40WSW7xMt6Q7FYHqrW4FjnR-8x92-jVgXzSt4yxWgPW31lVFf8F7-N5W5JZTR99lzn4YVLkSvW74QqDFW8qSR3Z7ftYlnW5FDdzP8R_JzyW8Q7dP918M912W7QGl653d9fcTW9574sv1rd66rW5jwL1G78r-1HN5Y8xpctzgDj3mPy1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-N3q905V1-WJV7CgL8VW2-09306D5vRzW540j0M5LqBVgW7hvLxR14TKjKW8jjTSq56__0dW99sT0G34Z0_MW74_D_t1pQ7ZRW39nXPC95w00FN4p0m_YlpR_GVD44x12Vh0YmW4DJKlk83svwlW2PrxG96jqqnHW4jN2nY38BYQQW59hr7B8qfklfW2gq6_v45Z_J0VdX-fD3PJlZTW5FfskM6NZHy6N72WTZNcy766W6_tMGZ4ZVJ0PW5XFFL57TB6x6W84dBsf3dM-LHW3x_xpY4yVYRNW6RxQ3k7SW7J7W826mxF6vxtc5VFT51q6Yxt7V32zs1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7Cg-pCW2rDB9l8Lj9skW2k2Yn080K6FRW2LKRZq6SbdLKN2w6hqRTd7XLW66swSS3mGWKDN1sFlZZKW8hrN6fJg_DlPf-1W2pL3Z17ZdWrxW92GRMX52d59VW8-cBjP5_6N4sW43KFpD3-TMhQW7pzyV15cyY6PW1Y9X2X8f1KDyW7fvWDQ67GlK3W2B2WP-4S59YFW7vwG7x208HNDW71tm9h7w70vcW7KYv2N2l2TnMW6pslPz2wvhvyW8bTJLc15KC4RW2-vkQY1R_sRgW3tYpvh944kTY37bC1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgSy2W571rJC2TfkPmW7hQBKy8x-JpyW7n4MKR350cCPW6bNS3v2MCLWGW3BgqyW8Z2W7JW14GxzW7Qf2SkW615J1v5_gF9bW4CRfhm29T1cDW4-L2vX7HvJprW1wdqsh5lL9BXVfdblV6kgqq6W5LWyN54hw4-LW36Nnbj8wnQ8pW8VS2Fn1kc1wQW2BJW5D97QXR-VBdRXk73TXgwW4CVFw12FnmDtW2ZQkpK40YSxNW8S4ypy22h1lGN5PxtLmD6jvZN9f1RW7yl4vJW4jtM5t6tlnNq3hH41
https://www.yardeni.com/pub/cc_20221031.pdf
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time-weighted average of analysts’ consensus operating earnings-per-share estimates for 
this year and next.) 
  
Admittedly, during the summer, we had thought that the June 16 low of 3666 was the 
bottom of the current bear market in the S&P 500. In our opinion, that level has provided 
some good support during the most recent selloff, which was triggered by more hawkish talk 
by Fed officials. 
  
Fortunately, Fed officials haven’t been talking this week because their blackout period 
started on October 22 prior to their FOMC meeting on Tuesday and Wednesday of this 
coming week. 
  
However, we will hear from Fed Chair Jerome Powell at his press conference on 
Wednesday. He should be a bit less hawkish than he was following the 75bps rate hike on 
September 21. At that point, he said this (emphasis ours): “[T]oday … we’ve just moved, I 
think, probably, into the very lowest level of what might be restrictive, and, certainly, in my 
view and the view of the Committee, there’s a way to go.” That certainly freaked out the 
bond and stock markets until recently. 
  
On Wednesday, the FOMC is expected to announce another 75bps hike to a range of 
3.75%-4.00%. That would make the fourth consecutive hike of that magnitude. Powell will 
have to acknowledge that the federal funds rate is now further into restrictive territory and 
will be even more so come the FOMC’s December meeting, when the rate is widely 
expected to be raised by 50bps to 75bps. 
  
Keep in mind that September’s FOMC Summary of Economic Projections showed that the 
committee’s median forecast for the federal funds rate was 4.4% by the end of this year and 
4.6% by the end of next year. The committee believed that would be restrictive enough to 
lower the PCED inflation rate from 5.4% this year to 2.8% next year. 
  
Strategy II: Has the S&P 500 Discounted a Hard Landing? One of our accounts recently 
asked us to assess the extent to which the stock market has discounted a garden-variety 
recession. That’s an interesting question. Joe and I have been thinking and writing about 
this question all year. 
  
Our current assessment is that the market has discounted a rolling recession, a.k.a. a “soft 
landing,” “growth recession,” or “mid-cycle slowdown.” We give this soft-landing scenario a 
60% subjective probability; the remaining 40% we assign to the hard-landing one. We think 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-N3q905V1-WJV7CgYcdF21rDXK7jZZW83XL4y7pk2PhW1yjrkK6YnSJ0W8N6c_y6K3j5KW7Thqck1TlC49N2tlJT7J5P4-W2pJgNs5m3X1QN86KVrdBF6ZfW1DGyRn40WBHzW3q0z8v34_HB_W1csX802q-V2QN975kmm9j8dZW97y-Vh6pKqYhV30B3g6JtdM9W7P_lt01Qck3TVPL4M13TMT3dW5cF_F07KWg-8W4vHH6_8n0JXLW54Dy9436_PdVW5y8dkF7WW761W67rcGP7GhpMkN77wv1wWLpHXW7X4XlV2SGnPJW3mJx_K99fvlV36t51
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investors have discounted the former but remain nervous about the latter. 
  
The stock market has been working on forming a bottom since September, finding support 
around the June 16 low of 3666, as we noted above. That bottom should hold if real GDP 
growth, on a y/y basis, hovers between 0.5% and 1.5% through the first half of next year 
and then recovers to more normal growth during the second half of next year, as discussed 
below. In addition, it should hold if the Fed delivers two more hikes in the federal funds rate 
by the end of this year (as is widely expected) and then pauses rate-hiking during the first 
few months of next year. Furthermore, the bottom should hold if inflation shows clear signs 
of moderating in coming months, as we continue to expect. 
  
Let’s examine the extent to which the stock market is discounting a soft landing or a hard 
landing. Since we think that it has mostly discounted the former, we reckon that the latter 
could send the S&P 500 down by another 10%-15% from its most recent bottom on October 
14. Consider the following: 
  
(1) LEI. The Index of Leading Economic Indicators (LEI) peaked at a record high during 
February and is down 2.9% through September (Fig. 5). As we’ve previously observed, the 
LEI has a good record of calling recessions. It peaked on average by 13.7 months before 
the previous seven business cycle peaks (prior to the pandemic). So the next business 
cycle peak is likely to occur next year around March or April and will be followed by the next 
recession, according to the LEI model. That could happen if the Fed is forced to resume 
tightening after a brief pause because inflation remains persistently high. That’s not our 
most likely scenario. 
  
(2) S&P 500. The S&P 500 is one of the 10 components of the LEI (Fig. 6). According to the 
S&P 500, the latest recession should have started already around May of this year. While 
the LEI is only available since January 1959, the S&P 500 is available starting in 1928. 
Since the end of WWII, the S&P 500 has peaked on average by five months before the past 
11 business cycle peaks (prior to the pandemic). 
  
By the way, with only one exception, the S&P 500 has bottomed near the ends of previous 
recessions, not before they’d even started! The one exception was the Tech Wreck bear 
market during the early 2000s, when the S&P 500 didn’t bottom until 11 months after the 
recession back then had ended. 
  
The current recession is the most widely anticipated downturn that hasn’t happened—so 
far. If it does happen, there is likely to be more downside for earnings and the valuation 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgFVQN6YdtYK5J80wMjjmbB2RrWPW4pw9qF8WHs6rVPVnHh6k5VkBW46N_t_3B13ZzW78ZpQP1D6frdW1h-yQC284vKNN1rjdx4yTKBgW4L-vPt10kCFrW60VqPy5JkKg5N8CVlh9GBsXdW2ZCJjq8SNVJ3N3sZf5zBWydsVgyQJj1Kvy01W2P9H4P1Xnp87W5GQxrq2hLTQDW1P1Mky5vMTrLW64t14m7cJ837W2Z-G2P3PrNHXW5MFyTg1pNYNWW1QCtdR5PQlkjW4qWcPS5Bq2s436mx1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgL4kW3yPqxh6SwCgNW3P9WRz3nrBSHVGgDkM37qG5dV952k45XCL8kW2Jbxw0972g73N6b0P8CGfkKzMzq_jLx1vQJW2DrwT38vy4R7W4FdpWn8X7bT9W63Lr392n7HBTW4cr7Hd1nXkK-VQFyC77GFR72W2gbStk4zmYYzW1lxL3n5V95k5W7NrJ192Ts26PVPS2573YMHZFW3-Xnx_9jf4T_W8j9-T08LjQ_dW29PwVv3d-HQjW2cXKY83LsJPDVd7Xc47Brz6_W6D9hfd2413lx3bGn1
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multiple, sending the S&P 500 still lower. Again, that’s not our most likely scenario. 
  
(3) History. The current bear market started on January 3 of this year. Let’s say that it lasted 
282 days, ending on October 12, when the S&P 500 was down 25.4%. That compares 
favorably with the average bear market: Since 1929, the prior 22 bear markets (including 
the brief 2020 pandemic selloff) lasted 341 days on average, with the S&P 500 falling 
36.6% on average (Table 1). Those were mostly hard landings, of course. 
  
(4) Forward earnings. As noted above, S&P 500 forward earnings rose to a record high 
during the June 23 week and has been relatively flat below that peak since then. The S&P 
500 is determined by its forward earnings multiplied by its forward P/E. The former is 
determined by industry analysts, while the latter is determined by investors. So far, forward 
earnings has been moving sideways, rather than diving as it invariably does during 
recessions as analysts—who rarely see recessions coming—scramble to slash their 
earnings estimates. 
  
During the October 20 week, industry analysts did continue to shave their earnings-per-
share estimates for the next five quarters from Q4-2022 through Q4-2023 (Fig. 7 and Fig. 
8). Nevertheless, their annual estimate for 2023 at $238.78 remained above their forward 
earnings of $235.58. Very soon, at the start of the new year, forward earnings will be giving 
increasingly more weight to the analysts’ estimate for 2024, which is currently $258.03 (Fig. 
9). 
  
(5) Forward P/E. The bears correctly observe that it would be very unusual to see the next 
bull market start at a forward P/E of around 15.0, which is the historical average of the P/E 
ratio (using reported earnings from 1935-1978 and forward earnings since 1979) (Fig. 10). 
Since the bears expect a hard landing, they conclude that the latest bear market hasn’t 
bottomed yet. It will do so only after analysts are forced by the coming recession to slash 
their estimates for S&P 500 revenues, profit margins, and earnings. Along the way, 
investors are likely to respond by further lowering the P/E multiple they are willing to pay for 
falling earnings. In this scenario, the P/E could fall much lower, especially if inflation 
remains stubbornly high during the recession, as happened during the Great Inflation of the 
1970s. Again, that’s the bears’ scenario, not ours. 
  
(6) Sentiment. Also supporting our view that the bear bottom has occurred is the extreme 
bearish readings in various surveys of investors’ sentiment. For example, this year, 
Investors Intelligence Bull-Bear Ratio has been below 1.00 for 17 of the 26 weeks since 
early May (Fig. 11). It can stay this low for quite some time during bear markets. But it tends 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-N3q905V1-WJV7CgMnrN6sYpqMvckkzW3NfXQS4MSJ7TF8sC03T5LDDW2xm2953MKpLmW8_DrRD8bX-zDW93r0QT5gTtzRW167Kjf4yJ70bW7YnpQ932M9JYW4DtSVl3nNmnMW2fyyDW8_cBMRW1Lwp6p7jY0tDW8bn1hR98g1zKW8lgS8l51ZR6FW1t8LRq644MDZW5wjwxp3PcGfFW47lRts1WzJ-xW5B-MSs1lbfSzW1c-LQZ4HBCVSW1fvZY47LDkk1W438XRN1l7BzMW8KMz8Q3YzPYFW3NQJBh3NTttPW7B5C-D3DMzCXN40swvCPMjM2345Y1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgHyDW95btbB4dkWx_W8WnQ8m7PQdXDVfQ0vW1wgDFyW1Y3zkr61K892W2GxCM03BV1S_W4-WJz8354ybHVRX7_N3pvTj7W5Dgrv-19rRH1W7s1HXh8XnBpwVg348V29dBr2W3BgW6n5Yr6XWW61Jpf413TMLhW50s7H92W9N7MW2P7kyT89DYGBW49Jc6H7Hf9PqW1f9Nfp1ds-sfW5PlKY-3Jtk4qVRKRW-8KL8TdVh-kp76G54PdW9ccxh153zz3rW4ChFWQ2H610tW587NP43Kx4Th37G71
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7Cg-5SW8Trplk3KnkkqN3trQLM_Z62vW1Bwmj1955ZR6W1Lgfx41yx16bW5BwDn_5TWKvvW99Hm-l85dbTxW6b38K35XCXmyN5MWTMlbKvTMW5NB0Xm494W2LW7x9C9H6yzQgPN8XFKK7R09HqW7H_s5K5rm0v3W2X-jpW5BwQvcW8DBcy52xHKQfW32Y3JK6Ybdv1W6jJNY56RvzndW2jH35c9dynLCN580YK0sGd2tW2z-M-t1FsHtcW36fbKm3hzLP-VXRrg_2_2S3TW3VGzdq1Pb8ZD33lP1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7Cg-5SW8Trplk3KnkkqN3trQLM_Z62vW1Bwmj1955ZR6W1Lgfx41yx16bW5BwDn_5TWKvvW99Hm-l85dbTxW6b38K35XCXmyN5MWTMlbKvTMW5NB0Xm494W2LW7x9C9H6yzQgPN8XFKK7R09HqW7H_s5K5rm0v3W2X-jpW5BwQvcW8DBcy52xHKQfW32Y3JK6Ybdv1W6jJNY56RvzndW2jH35c9dynLCN580YK0sGd2tW2z-M-t1FsHtcW36fbKm3hzLP-VXRrg_2_2S3TW3VGzdq1Pb8ZD33lP1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7Cgz_yW4YMFt75zXZj3W20hP6N37DmDdW2CXVfw2WCMnGW38sYnF4VtCF6W7sN-Zs1BrGKyW3CS_Cz10L4chW61KYwc48pp-1VpM5RB3lXHCTW6tW0hP5G5KpFW16J3NN3ZxW1YVRr3ql5w8m0ZV_JsZ61XF_J-W94z-_G8G72xVW3cFlgF7lvw1VW4T-kbZ7qyxqhW3Z5nxm10LykbW6kVxt036cTr1W2kYHcL44P3nGW7wVyP744KVvjW8WsCB04z7cXKW22yLtV5kCtLDW5hm8DQ2LN2lt3j151
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7Cgz_yW4YMFt75zXZj3W20hP6N37DmDdW2CXVfw2WCMnGW38sYnF4VtCF6W7sN-Zs1BrGKyW3CS_Cz10L4chW61KYwc48pp-1VpM5RB3lXHCTW6tW0hP5G5KpFW16J3NN3ZxW1YVRr3ql5w8m0ZV_JsZ61XF_J-W94z-_G8G72xVW3cFlgF7lvw1VW4T-kbZ7qyxqhW3Z5nxm10LykbW6kVxt036cTr1W2kYHcL44P3nGW7wVyP744KVvjW8WsCB04z7cXKW22yLtV5kCtLDW5hm8DQ2LN2lt3j151
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgXskW7HFwhw5ZbxcfW7Qnyk_8jJFLmW1dbBnV1rP0q8W2rSPWZ4Mbl6dW2mdN7-4Pn-t6W8-0wsj7H7SzdW5Fvhdh721Gr1W4HVq2d4vJ0KKW3x3tpm1_M74dW21Z3FT2G0By9V6xtq17x9G08W79ynnK8hVSt1W4Gwhk-68Ydy7W5Fnbgp7YskXQW7G330T6F4PBtW6Q70HX4wTBrjW8J3ClK1jNyW_W4_XjD98mnv9JN3WNnXfT1N-_W7C6dSg4dKxqHW2drDnv67zMgBN4JFKbQpVNc432Wr1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgBptW6kQc8V3tdQz4W7t3MGb8mCFl3W7Jxlw23yC_MyV7MFHk189bPSW1xkwwJ74pzkzW6x16Tr1mtRnkVRQpTc2CgDHyW5DMxGd6BFNGCW7j13KD8c7QpZW74q4Wd4ldh6mW2grHS96r5z5gW26KWTn2JwF98N6SYvWC1rLqXW8mNgSF8qhLsJV6WbZC5dV69jW3jZ49v657F24W3dv_vX3FV_Q2W4wbzKF3PS60mW2FzjHG1YMpNDVX0W4c2_GpmmW1_vBfz9j_cp6W5WKhX33FfHVB37361
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to be a very good contrarian “buy” indicator for long-term investors. 
  
Strategy III: Less Mega in MegaCap-8. So far this year through Friday, the performance 
derby shows that the eight very high-capitalization stocks known as the “MegaCap-8” (-
33.4%) collectively has underperformed the S&P 500 (-18.2%) and the DJIA-30 (-9.6%). 
The MegaCap-8 still accounts for 21.5% of the market capitalization of the S&P 500, but 
that’s down from a record 26.4% during the week of November 19, 2021 (Fig. 12). It still 
accounts for 48.0% of the market cap of S&P 500 Growth, down from the peak of 50.9% 
during the February 25 week. Here are a few more pertinent updates on the MegaCap-8: 
  
(1) Market cap. Since the S&P 500 peaked at a record high on January 3, the market cap of 
the MegaCap-8 is down 33.4%, or $4.0 trillion, through Friday’s close (Fig. 13). Their float-
adjusted market-cap decline of $3.3 trillion accounted for 44% of the $7.5 trillion drop in the 
S&P 500’s market cap over the same period. 
  
Here are the percentage and dollar declines (in billions) of the individual MegaCap-8 stocks 
ytd: Meta (-71.5%, -$669 billion), Nvidia (-53.2, -391), Netflix (-50.7, -135), Amazon (-37.7, -
638), Alphabet (-35.1, -674), Tesla (-32.0, -340), Microsoft (-30.4, -767), and Apple (-14.1, -
410) (Fig. 14). 
  
(2) Valuation. At 24.7, the forward P/E of the MegaCap-8 was still relatively high at the end 
of last week (Fig. 15). 
  
(3) DJIA. The DJIA-30 includes just one MegaCap-8, namely Microsoft. This concentrated 
portfolio is down just 9.6% ytd. It jumped 14.4% this month through Friday, representing its 
best October performance ever, going back to 1921, and its best month overall since a 
14.4% gain in January 1976. 
  
Strategy IV: Trading Corner. Here is Joe Feshbach’s latest call on the market: “Previously, 
I said this rally should take the S&P 500 up to the 3850-3900 range, and we’re right at the 
upper range. However, the short-term charts still look a little higher to me. The S&P 500 
took out its previous high of 3886, while the Nasdaq has not. The Nasdaq should exceed 
11682 before any short-term peak is reached, in my opinion. The put/call ratio has been just 
okay, but did have a huge day on the Meta shellacking, while breadth has improved but is 
still nothing to celebrate. So while the market should climb higher over the short term, I don’t 
think there is significant upside at this point, and most likely a trading range will ensue.” 
  
Movie. “All Quiet on the Western Front” (+ + +) (link) is a German production on Netflix of 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgFDxW4yjWzG7s545fN58Q0f0ZKGP8W49dvjC4DrrfCW1GwSKc2NggmCW3KRQhW1cLDJrW1fk75N2xWgDnW6tQf-W9lfpR0Mp5CCm3WghFV3xlHR3CLxxtVYp-4c8fTMvKW4HyVk43NX8FbW4MXk0h1Gx0q5W8L-W8z8KHRdlW57whcs4ThrKVN7CcPDRQWQj2W8gKllG1WcK2xV4BSVt5fLx2jW77nT34880SJgW4cxDh61_-Vj3W2xVQXX60RvGtW7tS3vc6cSz-7W787bkD4b4CH23jvd1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgPwNW37QWSV2cvzHwW988Nrk6hWGktW6lz3Nn8jvtkWW5Kdc2Z1dxZ3hW24yp0M6fQ_jcN29CkqYbxdxCW3rwr3c4mJ-J6W5lcWVK1nwl0bW6YRx9x4rdqDgW3TsT_Y61w8jbW4_jnFx63zjbLN4LYDwhr_dBlW5RP55K3P4Q0MV5tlbv5SdMynVK68L71xc4_3W1ts4Rv4LYm4BW8BNPHT5WWnV9W4BXVNv5rh4J2N7Gsh06pf9MfW38BjTy3-hRDrW3g0l5Q55f0PqW4XwQtf3xBbQY372V1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgFtjW8sCc4638C83sW6TkXyh1HNvTqW5tkZsQ66Y0_RW5_sFbM2MZPgpW8NhBfL86HSqFN4zCxfxLlS6rW8Wznjt5w6HfXW2DJwJN67LqDVW1Mn-NL3WtJVgW8FXG2-6xZ6KDW7tXBkK9kBvjCW17PRph537P2JW5S_8Qh79Kc91W809-DD366mNkW21hBkK4k40szW4fV8Sg1lL7ztMdphmC5FhYxW8rY20B7qgNPMW6mRX0R1vkjwdN4pVDlBtmH_6W6F-XK55c0vf9W6L-jDX7LyQH-34wF1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgPDZMT6vHm_DN69W84jd_G438vM7W4VPHNh2jml8HW7sFHzX8H7FP6W1_xD8L6psYwxW1WN8VZ2HxvrhW5FQt-v22-9HWVmmSw75LQp85W7Zk-9j26tYhjV93dR_6g8gfbW33k2jJ5YVJTBW3WG6X84hs01tW5DKSzX8pnYyjW3TTqqB7RbdCKW45fHmp1f4zSZM_rF0pjqB3cW48VhYX7FncCpW8qzBC-1NSCwLW3mcJ8337CKMjW85J1YP3Cp9trN57yYLtFSPLyF1nZ_SF-f_w359w1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgzT2VP7fNc2122NbW2f9TdR5P_4f_N1PK0dF7m1KGW946SfZ3ydfw9W2sBblD1SNNnxW1vnZrv9bn8CFW3fPwnd7WVhx9W6Bh9sM3Cfs0bW15rwj46HcMLsVFlndB8KL6VrW6GpK3k2rdtCsW2Gm42b48FLVkN8_g-KXMs0dSW2JKQ3L8tljwfW7spJjS2wqmq6N9cBpYHg_KhBW1D7cJP7vmXvFW6y8jMF7rH8rvW6srw2_62QfpYW58vV7H2jl9KRW3VvQfP23Dcf9W46DxHQ2yNc0F36541
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the Erich Maria Remarque’s book of the same name about the horrors experienced by a 
young German soldier fighting in the trenches during World War I. There is no glory in this 
anti-war movie. Wars have horrible consequences. The WSJ review observed that “the 
military high command on both sides … had 20th-century armaments and 19th-century 
thinking.” Unfortunately, we are seeing a similar disaster today in real time playing out in 
Ukraine. The weapons are much more destructive today and the thinking is just as primitive. 
The acting and the cinematography are superb. 

 

Calendars 
  
US: Mon: Dallas Fed Manufacturing Index; Chicago PMI. Tues: ISM Manufacturing & Price 
Indexes 49.9/53.0; Construction Spending -0.5%; Job Openings 10.00m; API Weekly Crude 
Oil Stocks; OPEC Meeting. (DailyFX estimates) 
  
Global: Mon: Eurozone CPI Headline & Core Flash Estimate 10.2%/4.8% y/y; Eurozone 
GDP 1.0%; Germany Retail Sales -0.3%m/m/-4.9%y/y; Spain Retail Sales; Italy GDP 
0.3%q/q/2.0%y/y; UK Nationwide Housing Prices; Japan Household Confidence 31.0; 
Japan M-PMI 50.7; China Caixin M-PMI 49.0; RBA Interest Rate Decision 2.85%; Lane. 
Tues: Germany Import Prices 0.6%m/m/31.7%y/y; UK M-PMI 45.8; Lowe. (DailyFX 
estimates) 

 

Strategy Indicators 
  
Global Stock Markets Performance (link): The US MSCI index rose 3.9% last week and 
posted its third gain in four weeks. The index finished the week out of a bear market at 
19.8% below its record high on December 27. The US MSCI ranked 24th of the 48 global 
stock markets that we follow in a week when 39 of the 48 countries rose in US dollar terms. 
The AC World ex-US index rose 2.3% and ended the week at 29.4% below its June 15, 
2021 record high, but most EM regions moved lower. EM Eastern Europe was the best 
performer with a gain of 7.2%, followed by EMU (5.3%) and EAFE (4.1). BIC was the worst 
performing region last week, with a decline of 5.7%, followed by EM Latin America (-3.4), 
EM Asia (-2.5), and EMEA (-0.8). Poland was the best-performing country last week, with a 
gain of 9.8%, followed by Austria (7.9), Sweden (7.5), and Ireland (7.3). Among the 12 
countries that underperformed the AC World ex-US MSCI last week, China’s 9.0% decline 
was the biggest, followed by those of Hong Kong (-7.7), Brazil (-7.6), Turkey (-3.5), and 

      
 

      
 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZZB5nKv5V3Zsc37CgX7pW5q0KHd3Ry99yW4cGzGp3GPv8hW3W-Hx71RNM6LW4fwCQJ4mqmXTW2mMvzC84hk-SW99bRfW99MyYhW2PGJyl66GMLDW1vsL1L4QL_NrW98Q0Zn4r7tRsW1Djbcv32wvShW6l0jg81RYKQGW2gM6qP8Qj6hFW4cWyDG19mF0NW4-qD1b5cXQGyW8CLzQ16Ht-ywW2byT014vm0ndV39Jq31VCcQlVg7CWW3Lvt7WW7lWpSc79WSTlW8rC3lj766rdVW7n_BS72rbKZMW4GLZ345qyLCBW1YH1ZS1W08FvW3BZpnb3qyQpXW4gT7pL1j8Wc_W5kHtYl4p8GhpW14WwYS3jSSQ7N44w6mjG6lyWW44dhjQ2gGfrpW3kY5TG79n26VW7FFdhy7p4lF7W6-t_cD2G22Y934MH1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgTryN4FLxBsp2qThMlqY5LrBfVsW3S7ry050Kqp0W2MdRK81cJpP5W4-Wd8K8bQyPhV7mlGJ6HGd3tW6cx_h_8l0G6HW62Lfkq4zGYzVW2VwyGW3z24GVN3tLRgQWcrz7VVTgt03zVDp4W8ymNHx1chRYkW8mnDnh8XZXM3W2txKVH6lXhpkW9frZ9q4WGtBdW3c9CfH8WNxPqW52S3Rm67wCdRW33r3th6Z6dzkW9jPXDk5fH1BmVv8KyT1xzPb7N6lX2PBWh5kvW1cq8Fr8-30sQ3p8y1
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Pakistan (-3.0). The US MSCI’s ytd ranking remained steady w/w at 20/49. After lagging for 
much of year through July, the US MSCI’s ytd decline of 19.3% is now less than the AC 
World ex-US’s 26.2% drop. EM Latin America is up 3.6% ytd and along with EAFE (-25.1) 
are the only regions outperforming the AC World ex-US. The laggards: EM Eastern Europe 
(-86.1), BIC (-35.2), EMEA (-35.1), EM Asia (-34.4), and EMU (-28.4). The best country 
performers so far in 2022: Turkey (35.8), Jordan (15.5), Chile (13.8), Argentina (9.3), and 
Brazil (7.9). Apart from Russia, in which investors have lost 100.0% of their investment this 
year, here are the worst-performing countries ytd: Sri Lanka (-67.2), Poland (-45.1), 
Hungary (-44.1), China (-43.1), and Taiwan (-41.8). 
  
S&P 500/400/600 Performance (link): All three of these indexes moved higher w/w for just 
the fourth time in 10 weeks and left bear market territory. LargeCap rose 4.0%, behind the 
gains for SmallCap (6.1%) and MidCap (5.3), which were these two indexes’ best 
performances in 22 weeks. LargeCap finished the week at 18.7% below its record high on 
January 3; MidCap is 16.3% below its record high on November 16; and SmallCap is 18.4% 
below its November 8 record high. Thirty-two of the 33 sectors moved higher for the week, 
the same as a week earlier. SmallCap Utilities was the best performer with a gain of 7.4%, 
followed by SmallCap Consumer Discretionary (7.2), SmallCap Industrials (7.1), MidCap 
Financials (6.9), SmallCap Real Estate (6.7), and LargeCap Industrials (6.7). LargeCap 
Communication Services (-2.9) was the biggest underperformer last week, followed by 
LargeCap Consumer Discretionary (0.7), MidCap Materials (2.3), LargeCap Energy (2.8), 
and MidCap Energy (3.2). In terms of 2022’s ytd performance, LargeCap’s 18.2% decline 
continues to trail those of MidCap (-14.3) and SmallCap (-14.6). Four of the 33 sectors are 
positive so far in 2022, up from three a week earlier. Energy continues to dominate the top 
performers: LargeCap Energy (62.2), SmallCap Energy (53.5), MidCap Energy (45.0), 
MidCap Consumer Staples (0.3), and MidCap Financials (-2.1). The biggest ytd laggards: 
LargeCap Communication Services (-38.5), SmallCap Real Estate (-29.8), LargeCap 
Consumer Discretionary (-29.7), LargeCap Real Estate (-28.9), and SmallCap Consumer 
Discretionary (-27.3). 
  
S&P 500 Sectors and Industries Performance (link): Ten of the 11 S&P 500 sectors rose 
last week, and seven outperformed the composite index’s 4.0% rise. That compares to a 
4.7% gain for the S&P 500 a week earlier, when all 11 sectors rose and five outperformed 
the index. Industrials was the top performer, with a gain of 6.7%, followed by Utilities 
(6.5%), Financials (6.2), Real Estate (6.2), Consumer Staples (6.1), Health Care (5.0), and 
Tech (4.3). Communication Services (-2.9) was the worst performer, followed by Consumer 
Discretionary (0.7), Energy (2.8), and Materials (3.3). The S&P 500 is down 18.2% so far in 
2022 with seven sectors ahead of the index and just one in positive territory. The best 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgYMLV2rnsf2n8SqhW6S0rpP5LzJfPW1X5l_H3dKkhzW60KWxJ5gTzT-W7Nv3F06wwqRkW8_MN6269skPbW5FsBdP3XsD2HW5wJ7fW7s_QdDW5KfSBj8KxNKFW7m69734lJ2XvW1nYmXY8dLStrW1b40Gx2k2w67W1Z1vF-31KXdmN3SgNWkvGQJxW7TSHBF5W-BwCW5bWNcD64hRRNW2dmtCD1YYKcNW5ZVRMr7w4ZjjW950cKf5SXCl1W33Ycnh71pHP_W3m8LjF1k_zcMW3ZPhWr80wk1Y36ss1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgXZrW2ZY11z52MvSYW4V015l3GCv4wW6y8t034-RvSfW6Ldlr-70GFRPW8y8x0s7p9Nn4W4DBYNb5lrhn1W3fXqwy3whmkMW7zYpFV72S47hW3FwHyS6_SwyWW6FX5f52Gyz0LVl11s18WS_4WVRLhff9cVYXbW4B2CF54y7xs-W2st9k44DH3zVW46ZH0N8ZqLP1W4t8Jh14-bRkbW6CntP18k0jS1W5Dw8Hj5Lk8m2W3nDRqb2QJTFwW8_98lg4sDbGCTHwmN7Lp0fDN1zjHfFknKJl3gPw1
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performers in 2022 to date: Energy (62.2), Consumer Staples (-5.3), Health Care (-5.8), 
Utilities (-5.9), Industrials (-10.6), Financials (-12.6), and Materials (-17.4). The ytd laggards: 
Communication Services (-38.5), Consumer Discretionary (-29.7), Real Estate (-28.9), and 
Tech (-25.7). 
  
S&P 500 Technical Indicators (link): The S&P 500 rose 4.0% last week and improved 
relative to its 50-day moving average (50-dma) and its 200-day moving average (200-dma). 
The index moved back above its 50-dma for the first time in seven weeks, but closed below 
its 200-dma for the 36th time in 39 weeks. It had been above its 200-dma for 81 straight 
weeks through early February. The S&P 500’s 50-dma moved lower for the 20th time in 26 
weeks as the index improved to 1.7% above its falling 50-dma from 3.2% below a week 
earlier and a 15-week low of 10.6% below at the end of September. That compares to a 23-
month high of 8.7% above its rising 50-dma the week in early August and a 27-month low of 
11.1% below its falling 50-dma in mid-June. The index had been mostly trading above its 
50-dma from late April 2020 to early April 2022; in June 2020, it was 11.7% above, which 
was the highest since its record high of 14.0% in May 2009. That compares to 27.7% below 
on March 23, 2020—its lowest reading since it was 29.7% below on Black Monday, October 
19, 1987. The price index closed Friday at 4.8% below its falling 200-dma, up from 8.8% 
below a week earlier and an 18-week high of 0.8% below in early August. It remains above 
its 26-month low of 17.1% below its falling 200-dma in mid-June. The latest reading is down 
sharply from 10.8% above its rising 200-dma in November 2021. That compares to 17.0% 
above in December 2020, which was the highest since November 2009 and up from the 
26.6% below registered during the Great Virus Crisis on March 23, 2020—the lowest 
reading since March 2009. At its worst levels of the Great Financial Crisis, the S&P 500 
index was 25.5% below its 50-dma on October 10, 2008 and 39.6% below its 200-dma on 
November 11, 2008. The 200-dma fell for a 26th straight week, but its pace of decline is 
slowing now from its fastest rate since July 2009.  
  
S&P 500 Sectors Technical Indicators (link): Seven of the 11 S&P 500 sectors are trading 
above their 50-dmas, up from two sectors a week earlier. These four sectors still trade 
below their 50-dma: Communication Services, Consumer Discretionary, Real Estate, and 
Utilities. At the end of September, all 11 sectors were below. Energy and Health Care are 
the only sectors with a rising 50-dma. Looking at the more stable longer-term 200-dmas, 
Health Care and Industrials joined Energy in the latest week as the only sectors above that 
measure. For perspective, at the depths of the Great Virus Crisis in April 2020, Health Care 
was the only sector trading above its 200-dma. Health Care also joined Energy as the only 
sectors with a rising 200-dma now. 

       
 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-N3q905V1-WJV7CgMpYW6ZDs-P3nwjBdW49RSjX5_-cZJW81m_DC31CvJ5W5Py5mN417z4LVh8QCy8RlB9jW1z-gC77wWkRhN81BGCXVGClXW6flhDx25Ss-FW82ZSn04VrYNFMZFQrdrbw-zW1W5zbH3QkM1PW6lRGHR312n6-W6-j_3H3JzbnRVLBQBs1zJ_YrW60ckKM73mybCW4WCLll59mDP9W6NkVhB5N-Lg_W92q5wN1kylnXW9m5n-H5YRSqBW5RrHFV8C-L-lW5qQXbc43b5q-N6mlSYLd4-8CW4Sb11Y8phd06N6FPFg7jVJzq3nlb1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-N3q905V1-WJV7CgSL_W7fcWg_7NwCQVW2b6tc671qmNyW2gBD6l7g9zKFW3JKyCT1Ty63mW35TPR49cp_z1W7VBh7H7lh0xgW49CR8h2sFQT-W7YBcn83wGp6HW272BpZ7F59vpW9m5bc88dvTkxVrRJx63f8K7QW1ttxXh3Jwhc7W8Kb-JL8nSW92W2l6msK2xR4wlW2T7spR1WBnMvW836ytF1fD6LgW2Tzwdn8ByqG6V6glDH8V4vcsW4vz4Yq2fl2V5W2lzKYl95LR-lW6gTTpV8npPcTW8h9S_s8hXG0kW1Wz3pR5PkB_-W11s96l7TSV_P350Q1
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US Economic Indicators 
  
GDP (link): Real GDP expanded during Q3 for the first time in three quarters, though there 
were more signs of weakness than strength. The economy advanced 2.6% (saar) last 
quarter after contracting 0.6% and 1.6% the prior two quarters, with yearly growth at a paltry 
1.8%. Real consumer spending increased only 1.4% (saar), following gains of 2.0% and 
1.3% the prior two quarters, with the yearly percent change slowing from a peak of 16.6% 
during Q2-2021 to only 2.0% last quarter. Real consumer goods consumption contracted for 
the third straight quarter, slumping 1.2% (saar) during Q3, with both nondurable (-1.4) and 
durable (-0.8) goods consumption in the red; services consumption slowed to 2.8% (saar) 
from 4.6% during Q4. Meanwhile, real gross private domestic investment contracted 8.5% 
(saar), following a 14.1% drop during Q2, as investment in real residential (-26.4%, saar) 
and nonresidential structures (-15.3) continued to post double-digit declines, while inventory 
investment continued to slow. Meanwhile, real nonresidential investment expanded 3.7% 
(saar) after virtually no growth during Q2 as spending on equipment (10.8) and intellectual 
property products (6.9) continued to show healthy growth, more than offsetting the decline 
in nonresidential structures. Real inventory investment was a drag on growth again last 
quarter, slowing to $61.9 billion from $110.2 billion and $214.5 billion the prior two quarters. 
Meanwhile, real GDP got a big boost from trade, with real net exports of goods & services 
narrowing $156.5 billion, to -$1.27 trillion, as exports (14.4%, saar) posted another double-
digit gain last quarter, while imports (-6.9) contracted. Real government spending expanded 
2.4% during Q3 after declining the prior two quarters by 1.6% and 2.3%.  
  
Contributions to GDP Growth (link): Trade was by far the biggest positive contributor to 
real GDP during Q3, followed by consumer spending, nonresidential fixed investment, and 
government spending. Trade contributed 2.77ppts to Q3 real GDP, with both exports 
(1.63ppt) and imports (1.14) adding to the top line. Real consumer spending contributed 
0.97ppt to Q3 real GDP as growth in services consumption (1.24) more than offset the 
contraction in goods consumption (-0.28)—with nondurable goods consumption (-0.20) 
accounting for most of the decline in the latter. Nonresidential fixed investment added 0.49 
to real GDP as positive contributions from equipment (0.54) and intellectual property 
products (0.36) more than offset the drag from structures (-0.41). Equipment spending was 
a mixed bag, with positive contribution from spending on transportation equipment (0.63) 
and information processing equipment (0.18) more than offsetting the negative contributions 
from industrial equipment (-0.17) and other equipment (-0.11). Government spending added 
to real GDP growth for the first time since Q1-2021, with both federal (0.23) and state & 
local (0.19) spending contributing. In the meantime, residential investment was a drag on 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgYc_W5Ff1Q58HFFx3N1ZZc8jPhBwGW7KXNC94QvTMhW4dXSYX1yq6D9W5GXm_J4HhFK-V9Cd7W1SMPj4W6nCtdl2Cl_QNW7ZqJDP1XcZ6fW8RVnTt20R5G-W9dh4pk7CQyRRW99Kj6w7R913NW4Lrh2t7BVyhjW6QDKqH2vG-zBW5SM2Pn28wqRgW2hmmN35Fqh0XW2ByHT52j_fTBW8s7lc16klG69W36CmXb7nghlgW4N8L9f6h3RdPVTny708BPh44W3GZ4SZ6xcK4TW7QvDYp92JYtQ37fw1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgN1VW1GDVbr6FjfJJW6HB1c15JYrFyW3NbV-C1YgXNPW3XQmfQ4LpgPKW8Zwr0q1kM7PSW1SLRjf6dB1bFW67GF5J1kTl8jW3vTWx71l21D2N2-KVNG7xdYZW8X5Msf377bXRW8j79Z76fPxfrW3TDdTj6z2kM6W1phTs571D8ghW2byyVF8VlW96W29y2YB1ZG_FqW2DfP3Z17z-NbW1RQbdk8Cp4HNW2ZsrsZ4Hg43vW8PPJvD7lTGNfVp5_wZ5qt77GW2F5Ymt2CgKP2W1k9xG64JK1h03fF11
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real GDP for the sixth successive quarter, subtracting 1.37ppt last quarter, while inventory 
investment (-0.70) subtracted from real GDP growth for the second consecutive quarter. 
  
Personal Consumption Deflator (link): September’s PCED rose 0.3%, matching August’s 
pace which followed a 0.1% downtick in July—which was the first monthly decline since 
April 2020; the measure had increased 1.0% in June. Meanwhile, core prices rose 0.5% for 
the second straight month in September after showing no change in July  The yearly 
headline rate held at 6.2%, down from June’s 7.0% peak—which was the highest reading 
since the end of 1981; it was at 4.6% a year ago. The yearly core rate accelerated for the 
second month to 5.1% in September after slowing from 5.0% in June to 4.7% in July; it 
peaked at 5.4% during February and March. On a three-month annualized basis, the core 
rate slowed to 4.2% in  September after climbing from 4.2% in July to 4.9% in August; it was 
at 5.3% in June. The three-month rate for durable goods slowed to 2.8% (saar) in 
September, easing for the second month since June’s 5.1%, while the three-month rate for 
core nondurable goods prices slowed to 2.3% from August’s 4.8%. Meanwhile, services 
prices ex energy is hovering just below its recent June peak of 5.4% (saar) for the third 
month, ticking down to 4.5% in September. The three-month annual rates for consumer 
durable goods (2.8%, saar & 5.7% y/y), consumer core nondurable goods (2.3 & 3.8), and 
consumer core services (4.5 & 4.9) prices were all below their yearly rates. PCED 
components for which three-month rates lag yearly rates: gasoline & other energy products 
(-83.2% & 20.2%), lodging away from home (-17.6 & 3.1), household appliances (-17.0 & 
0.4), airfares (-10.8 & 32.9), used motor vehicles (-6.0 & 7.1), sports & recreational vehicles 
(-3.7 & -0.2), clothing & footwear (-1.0 & 5.7), hospitals (1.1 & 2.9), recreation services (1.5 
& 4.5),  prescription drugs (2.4 & 2.7), alcoholic beverages purchased for off-premise 
consumptions (2.9 & 3.0), professional & other services (3.8 & 7.0), transportation services 
(6.0 & 16.4), tobacco (6.4 & 8.2), furniture & home furnishings (7.8 & 10.2)), new motor 
vehicles (8.8 & 9.3), motor vehicles & parts (10.2 & 12.7), food & nonalcoholic beverages 
purchased for off-premise consumption (12.1 from 13.4). PCED components for which 
three-month rates exceed yearly rates: personal care products (11.4 & 6.8), tenant rent (9.2 
& 7.2), owner-occupied rent (8.7 & 6.7), education services (2.7 & 2.3), physician services 
(1.7 & 0.2), and video audio & information processing (0.4 & -0.7).  
  
Consumer Sentiment Index (link): Consumer sentiment confirmed its preliminary estimate, 
edging up just 1.3 points this month to 59.9 in October, but was just 9.9 points above its all-
time record low of 50.0 in June. The report notes that while lower-income consumers 
reported sizable gains in overall sentiment, consumers with considerable stock market and 
housing wealth showed notable declines. The October present situation component climbed 
for the fourth month from 53.8 to 65.6, while the expectations component fell 1.8 points to 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgYWdW8kX1tG8Z3fsqW6TGhgF3DYvVQW1Ws0cG5rjb_fW7W4Mzt8gs4M1W2jqw4G1TnhqdW6LzyR61hfNnHW7Sf05b8CjMjRW1G2-kL7tBgKpW6qDQcc4vCPzvW40CZvq2FP6mvW5k221f262Tv4N5twj2phB7TnMXSgcM-Ms6MW7MQ5_X4BtlxSW7krXzD4qPZMKW4YPZNv7C0vjsW3pSCsN4-pw2bW7PjBL63DLQc5W2tZBpv73mn_4W7x-dLF5xrlgYW1RX0wN8fWrmsW2yNj5c6RMklt3gTv1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7Cg-d7W3ZXh-c2y0lv1W86kFNv2ltQFnW6l2sCS1xRQ6gVWl_261GJ5qsW13x1GT7hBGnWW34GwMv1N1H3ZVrTbBd2t4y_0VtF_ys4dvsGrW3JPVjC1Fxh5LW48Rhyb28wJrYW6d4BTs3M0zlgW6_91FG4jrq-sW8__7ZN5rcXqLW5DCQVP4LhJnMW2TsStQ5zFTG5W6dF0G38vtH4HW5NvVF14Xf6Q7N1jhLchZlgWkW2VqbT-8g8w9XVlBnGt94cZQ4W4tf5y15m_F75W1gLvh82z4QGv3f1h1
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56.2 after no change in September; it had jumped a surprising 10.7 points in August. The 
one-year expected inflation rate rose to 5.0% this month after easing steadily from 5.3% in 
June to 4.7% by September, with increases reported across age, income, and education. 
The five-year expected inflation rate climbed back up to 2.9%, after falling to 2.7% in 
September—which was the first time it fell below the 2.9%-3.1% range since last July. 
According to the report, “Uncertainty over inflation expectations remains elevated, indicating 
that inflation expectations are likely to remain unstable in the months ahead.” 
  
Employment Cost Index (link): Compensation for private workers are rising, but not if you 
adjust for inflation. Compensation in private industry increased 1.1% during Q3, with wages 
and salaries up 1.2% and benefits up 0.8%—and all three measures slowing from Q2 gains 
of 1.5%, 1.6% and 1.3%. The yearly inflation rates slowed for all three measures from their 
recent peaks during Q2: compensation (to 5.2% from 5.5%), wages & salaries (5.2% from 
5.7%), and benefits (5.0% from 5.3%). Adjusting for inflation, total compensation is down 
2.8% y/y, with wages & salaries and benefits falling 2.7% and 3.0%, respectively. Yearly 
rates for goods-producing industries show a slowing in total compensation (to 4.6% from 
4.7%) from the Q2 peak, reflecting a slowing in benefits (5.0 & 5.3); the wages & salaries 
(5.0 & 4.7) rate continues to accelerate. Looking at service-providing industries, the 
compensation (5.4 & 5.8) rate eased along with wages & salaries (5.3 & 5.9), while benefits 
(5.4 & 5.3) showed a slight uptick. The real compensation measure for goods-producing 
industries fell 3.4%, with wages & salaries and benefits down 2.9% and 4.2%, respectively, 
while these rates for service-providing industries fell 2.6%, 2.7%, and 2.6%. 
 
Durable Goods Orders & Shipments (link): Durable goods orders in September posted a 
smaller-than-expected gain, though climbed to its highest level since July 2014. Meanwhile, 
core capital goods orders and shipments both dipped in September after a string of gains to 
new record highs. Nondefense capital goods shipments excluding aircraft (used in 
calculating GDP) slipped 0.5% last month, but that was after climbing in every month but 
one since its April 2020 bottom, by a total of 34.8%, to a new record high. Meanwhile, core 
capital goods orders (a proxy for future business investment) slumped 0.7% in September 
after advancing all but four months since April 2020, climbing 35.6% over that 28-month 
period to a new record high. Total durable goods orders rose 0.4% in September, smaller 
than the 0.6% expected gain, while revisions showed August’s 0.2% decrease was revised 
up to a 0.2% increase. September’s gain was led by a 2.1% jump in transportation 
equipment orders to its highest level since summer 2014, while durable goods orders 
excluding transportation recorded its first decline in seven months, sinking 0.5%, led by 
notable declines in orders for communications equipment (-3.2%), primary metals (-1.7), 
and electrical equipment, appliances & components (-1.3).  

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgKhsW5rrGQh4Lr_phW3QsWX02JRcZGW37kVgh7QXCGKMLPm5ydGySNN5Zh1yMSBCxmW56gwvM6gFJ6FN35jq465CCVbW6s5lzk3y_P0vVVcrXx7Qxg-vW1rftR21sZcFcW3vs3ST9k59BNW1h_M782zlk9cN5GTQcHKw8lVW75R6_C3sYtVsW8mnVwR33YzHYW5Pp9hF6vjhxCN7HtBVWq8jRvW2Qxt085TCKR_W6sMTkd7W69n7N2ttLQ3hMjQ5W1jYylJ3tVMxtW4pSlz78C0VXh33Nk1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgB28W8hq7h73lg50nMgQMJTX6MrgW4fW32h66xs57W6NpsjZ5dVMkdW7jvvHf1qD8kvW3n3fB96QmdsjW91XV1_7MLxwYVy6JQW7KDnFdW8whhNS7Jrcj0W31LSWZ7LT15XN7VjlyP8jrfKN776Y-cj4CNrW45WfTx30BMlXW4RT8W82BgTC6N2xy0wHmx7S_W8FdKlV70qC7MN7CMRmBZX2QYN6Nyzq3WXKQ6W19gfMx3Szf89W2CRGZw2MRBDJVzvdnn8m7G0qW2XMR518YjS8D3cVc1
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Pending Home Sales (link): “Persistent inflation has proven quite harmful to the housing 
market,” said Lawrence Yun, NAR’s chief economist. “The Federal Reserve has had to 
drastically raise interest rates to quell inflation, which has resulted in far fewer buyers and 
even fewer sellers.” The Pending Home Sales Index (which tracks sales when a contract is 
signed but the transaction has not yet closed) fell for the fourth successive month by 10.2% 
in September and 20.2% over the period to 79.5—the lowest since April 2020. Regionally, 
pending home sales fell in all regions on both a monthly and yearly basis; here’s the tally: 
South (-8.1% m/m & -30.0% y/y), Midwest (-8.8 & -26.7), West (-11.7 & -38.7), and 
Northeast (-16.2 & -30.1). Yun noted, “The new normal for mortgage rates could be around 
7% for a while. . . . Only when inflation is tamed will mortgage rates retreat and boost home 
purchasing power for buyers.”  

 

Global Economic Indicators 
  
Eurozone Economic Sentiment Indicators (link): The Economic Sentiment Indexes (ESI) 
for both the EU and Eurozone continued to slide in October, falling to their lowest levels 
since August and November 2020, respectively. The EU’s ESI (-1.5 points to 90.9) is down 
25.7 points since its recent peak of 116.6 last October, while the Eurozone’s (-1.1 to 92.5) is 
25.4 points lower than its 117.9 peak last October. ESIs among the six largest EU 
economies were mixed, with ESIs in Germany (-1.0 to 90.9) and Italy (-0.9 to 95.0) falling, 
while being essentially unchanged in the Netherlands (-0.3 to 90.3) and France (unchanged 
at 96.2); ESIs improved slightly in Poland (+0.4 to 88.6) and Spain (+1.4 to 98.0). By sector, 
Industrial confidence fell further into contractionary territory, dropping nine of the 10 months 
since reaching a record high of 12.9 in December, plunging to -2.6 in October—slipping 
below zero last month for the first time since January 2021. Services confidence has been 
sliding since its recent peak of 17.9 last October, declining to a 18-month low of 1.9 this 
October on widespread weakness. Meanwhile, consumer confidence (to -28.9 from -29.6) 
was little changed from September’s record low, while construction (-0.2 from -0.4) barely 
budged from its recent low; retail trade (-7.0 from -7.8) confidence picked up slightly due to 
a marked improvement in retailers’ assessment of the past business situation.  
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https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgMs6W7j2ZzH5-xV1gMw71CdgQ5yVV5grQF7hWstyW3QtF001KWL4ZW2vTD9N5zj6TvN1vhNBZBdgLvW7nddF95JNbckW4C4JvN3Myr0TW1Ygx_N1T-pZ6W7nXnS_2sPjpBW5swm688FvLv-W5K4WzT4HwgCHM8C937_hGc_W4l-cGL3NVnyrW2Xw_-z8HtHJTMcfrTSJs__sN4xVdl-HZxqhW2-dGBY14MZSvW1N5B258RvzfpW6QcrT86WkCzzW5qSH8l74fGQlW2671_c3qhVvH37VT1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VVNqhx8yyY5FVf18rc3xLPX8W1qZjFf4RNhC0N76MZ-t3q8_QV1-WJV7CgTT-VqMb6m7jnkqyN1qNttgf2N-HW7qy97-8HhBS1W7pkSQ53GzYhFV46bMR6pQ67mW8sdt-S79THThVrXF465ZqSQ7W9cfJ646X0r01W7NxVZN3l_cmXW6w046C5kbgRBW7Pf4p_6SCmK9W1jTXzV85_P7wW553-dT3Kt0vVW6S1-KQ8M8PBzVlw19G5NZJ5yW7pGt1Z8Y5v4bW2xRR4Z2bL0XkW91sTz96Dxn_MW5tm4NS4vglLzVHMB5n5nqby6W8XrYps8HzlQWW1BqQ-D4N_5-P3kH61
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