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Inflation I: Wages. Debbie and I have some good news and some bad news on the 
inflation front. Wage inflation appears to be moderating according to the average hourly 
earnings (AHE) measure of wages but is still moving higher based on the Atlanta Fed’s 
wage growth tracker (WGT). Consider the following: 
  
(1) AHE. The AHE is available for all workers since March 2006 and for production and 
nonsupervisory (PNS) workers since January 1964. This measure reflects not only changes 
in basic hourly and incentive wage rates but also such variable factors as premium pay for 
overtime and late-shift work and changes in the output of workers paid on an incentive plan. 
It also reflects shifts in the number of employees between relatively high-paid and low-paid 
work and changes in workers’ earnings in individual establishments. 
  
The AHE inflation rate for all workers moderated from a recent peak of 5.6% y/y during 
March to 5.1% during June (Fig. 1). For PNS workers, who account for 81.5% of payroll 
employment, it moderated from 6.8% to 6.4% (Fig. 2). Both series have been very volatile 
since the pandemic. During the lockdowns, more of the lower-wage PNS workers lost their 
jobs than higher-wage workers, who could work from home. That misleadingly boosted the 
AHE measure of wage inflation. Then the AHE misleadingly went the other way when the 
lockdown ended, allowing more of the lower-wage workers to find jobs again. 
  
By now, the AHE measure should be a more accurate measure of underlying wage inflation. 
If so, then it is showing that wage inflation may be moderating. During June, when the AHE 
rose 5.1% y/y, it rose 4.2% on a three-month percentage-change basis, suggesting that 

 
Check out the accompanying chart collection. 
  
Executive Summary: Consumer prices, wages, home prices, rent: They’ve all been surging 
northward at stunning rates. Today, we take a deep dive into the wage-price-rent spiral. … We 
examine recent rent data, how they’re measured, and the forces that drive them—such as the 
plummeting affordability of home purchasing. … Regarding wages, one measure suggests wage 
inflation may be moderating, while the other shows it is still very high. … We still expect inflation to 
moderate, led by nondurable and durable goods inflation. The risk is that the wage-price-rent spiral 
continues, forcing the Fed to trigger a recession—which always has brought inflation down in the past. 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgG4MW82t0mG7XmfMVW29zQ9g3VL9JpW3MyDY734h1JJW1FdG4W1mpL-mW6y4btW3cRTtlW3L62sd4fhMmBW3lMlKR2-J4h_W2HBknT6rKbpqW8bw4jf2jr-sDW99HBlD3FZ3NvW8TCTRw2Lr77kN4N2ZMXQMbW4W6KR4hc5Yk-ZdVr8QLh1dlbr3W9cDq258dfs1JVxpYDr1yVr8pN1dr3ysbRh2GW2sDs-D7DK8G4W4GfZ4t99qb9QW7Z20w65-4tttW7Hs5Rq1bqjjzW1l-fNm952DHQ3dsQ1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgXHrW7thgTT45hp7LW7-qwt65pFS0lN486W2gJnzr5N2XYxQnDQsg_W14zvsX3WD95zW2x3WNW3RyZWxW6NJwZ01ln2dSW4jhBj-7LqF74W6gSwzS5xVjGwVD0Nrn2mtP6cVJNV0938VWgmW4GF3Bp9dnHl1W1HyhB95mTsvVW2Zv6fT2MRnRJW5RKgQb75MMGnW3xdSLQ6qWPLLW7kw3wd66wVvbW5Qf-dX5--QJyW1VtgjY2KYN8pVm9slQ67f8GQW4WV-mp1cXfBRW2BpC2H3H0Gdh31bP1
https://www.yardeni.com/pub/cc_20220719.pdf
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inflationary pressures are subsiding (Fig. 3). Interestingly, lower-wage workers have been 
getting bigger wage increases than higher-wage workers, with the former up 6.4% y/y (and 
5.8% over the past three months) through June and the latter up 2.5% (but just 0.6% over 
the past three months) (Fig. 4). 
  
(2) WGT. The WGT series tracks the median wage growth rate, not the median wage. It 
calculates the wage growth of surveyed people who were working over the course of a year 
and constructs a distribution of growth rates, which is used to calculate three-month 
moving-average medians. As a result, the WGT has been less volatile than the AHE 
measure of wage inflation (Fig. 5). 
  
According to the WGT, wage inflation hasn’t yet slowed down; it rose to 6.7% during June 
from 6.2% during May. There are also no signs of moderating wage pressures in the WGT’s 
various components. For example, during June, the WGT for job switchers and job stayers 
jumped to 7.9% and 6.1%, respectively (Fig. 6). That 1.8ppt differential certainly explains 
why so many workers have been quitting their jobs for better paying ones (Fig. 7). 
  
According to the WGT, on a 12-month moving average basis through June, wages are up 
5.4%. For younger workers, they’re soaring, with gains of 12.5% for 16- to 24-year-olds 
versus 5.6% for 25- to 54-year-olds and 3.7% for workers 55 and older (Fig. 8). By industry, 
the 12-month gains are: leisure & hospitality (6.4%), trade & transportation (5.9), 
manufacturing (5.8), finance & business services (5.5), construction & mining (4.9), 
education & health (4.9), and public administration (4.6). 
  
(3) Real wages. In a perfect world, wages would be rising at a moderate pace that exceeds 
price inflation by the growth rate in productivity. During a wage-price spiral, productivity 
growth suffers as wages and prices spiral higher. So real wages tend to stagnate. That’s 
what is happening currently: On an inflation-adjusted basis, AHE for all private workers is 
down -1.0% y/y through May, while AHE for PNS workers is up just 0.1% (Fig. 9 and Fig. 
10). 
  
Inflation II: Rents. As we’ve previously discussed, the wage-price spiral is really a wage-
price-rent spiral. While there are a few glimmers of moderating wage inflation in the AHE 
measure, there’s no sign of relief from the uptrend in rent inflation that started during March 
2021. Consider the following: 
  
(1) Home prices & rents. The Fed’s ultra-easy monetary policies in response to the 
pandemic caused home prices to soar, and now rents are soaring. Over the 24 months 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgGRxW5GZkD58l_YysW2B6jWY25HZMKW2-X2-G6vFB4fVySGwB36G2B3W87FXFc6PfqQwW36W6M16vlG5qN222LNVyh5QKW2pr9Hd7Psfz4W5v_jHd64dFchW1Y8mlP5XN7B2W694XY64LwK7wW1cjXnh1P5vSnN68f5RVM_YvPW8HXWGD2YhFbyVltmhv4C514TW5y5Z7j4Bgr_9W6s46m72XxQdBW8Pqvp52sW5cyVQtKJz55wQ4YW97MHZV3L4v28W4M8SX_7VS32WW5c19xg5XHmCd34nq1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgW-RW2ndTqT8Wr3sPW3lznqv6M6f2hW1mYLmh2TvWgqW3ZZ_Zv3Ph_zLW8SlXSZ5NqMNYW18L4Zt3CXVKzV4tTWC5Cpw2CW6v8NMM74S41KW5nKdn-1MdSL4Vv8C1317YFM7W2qD2dZ18hxvBW48dPDN6cwy9SW1lKm_W7v5lmwW7QKR3s1kbpYYW7fXmn78jqgrCW772bwj7s-RV_W8B37N27PDWtsW7H50Hb2FLFJHW2Y4BLH94syhnW6Gh5zh3tdtbxW6ZwLN_9gyHCrW6cHk3z8rFmKm39_81
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgJZbW85LqfR4dHLg6W1WW5tw13Kym3W3H54Nm3WXCNHW5xP3j06vnvfjW8Z1hqY6M08l_W7qp2F96k6Nh1W2rhFjj8LT6SgW8tDcxG5dLsJQW1Z1b9s84yH3YW2tFNtF1nKFK2W8w6hl21XpxmdN87GQKWnPQ5SW7PZc__8p2z6zW8Trk6Y4ZHNwFVM75v54x9TlQN6w7klYdmGNpW8rbXyr8llGV_W65b2rB2LhvR0W7gHH2Q3wKqfqW1NLbFS40J027W4cW6Dz3By7QDW59hPl87RHkl63hgW1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgVlyW34wGW61jNPV9N7XBd9nrPd40W5ZfGg97T9swjW6fJJWy36mg3-W6Y_QNz8PxynZW31F_T44MwfNTW4NSgcn4wNPndW7xGmd13t6hNjW8_6sNy96GtwBW2YdbZ72_JWFnW1MkW2G2-Ng_cN218tY_dvV99VlgyW98hnTsdN4wkdmR650JNW4tSbPD3cTZkNW4HWsXd5807GXW7r1hnR8WNy98N1bCt-WKGkpdW7q13yh4jjVNYW7RYc_Z967XLwVtgJ7d2-Wz8LVJz0Hv83byXC3bdn1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7Cg-gpW20TrfD1Jzn6xW3LFccD2NsygpW4Rs-Pz5wqJTLW8M5fjw8CG1FBW87HY0Z8-pn3RW7PshS43DQlV-W6k6tWw1tHtP8W1M7tF28hp0WjW73rRPy2gg26sW7dS8cm7drzV1W4mZ0N02sJGTbW81rytZ8tsh5mW3j9KKc5q8RwKN6y4S6HBL-3TW4nVzCg70YVwYVjzgM23N58QJW4VpPRL8wwkbgV97q8H1TyN-8W89D-2Y4pTDFdW3xVcNf3G8PZwW4dJDQW4MzsFFW3_VT7N1ckLYN318V1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgQ9jW7ScB-t3P4hCxW5bWTlg26jLbKN5TM5lS-NfJHW8rMSBw8WLVndW8R2_BF3K-ZnwW5MzNW66L_dVBW5fWNyy2Z8F5kW4vYh4S5-dNTfW3Nyx4Y3RBvRmW7pvPSM7BjKvpN5fK6z4Jy37-W2Hb0Rw3123l4W2V9gwl3FNLwMW8qnwcm7wgG1pW225yMS41Q3PNW3Nbmz36PPjMMW3mp8DR5r3NR5W5l4KQz5mdsDvW5W7SYJ5nt7G4W57RF3m5z3fWXW2C5TMQ3H7nTHW2lw56j6TsrN63lBc1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgP_QW7CL-7p26QmqcW2Brx-921x_0wW1p9VQC8vq-DfN4rB6M_P9V3CW7m3GG57JgH5KW2Qp0S13xL7L_W2WkJR61wNLkBW8pJ0yH86_014W3fY_5x2Sb0LBW5w_gvp290fJ5VCpGlD7Z1gfJV8bL-w4HkF-mW7c3v6q5VK14cVM3s5g4cqvb4W7zygK64YvKFrVfh9ND7VyXqZW8TvVjp3KxKQFVFKfHm5HcbNjW2P3jx61fpqbwW5kngZC865jZLW5Z3-C32x9HSGW1bGPx98MYFzW3hB91
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgH1fW94sdfc7rVBMhW6HVCfx1FjKQGW9g_s2B3JSsYmW8hRlNR13TQwPW37zLJZ8LkMBVW55R7wT5MlR1mW9204FL9hbM1xW2tt16b61LS-fW452N4h6NnkwpN2lNKzKGFlNhW7Tl1KW54DQXKW4J191Y2sm0NKW7VKbFG6FKRvLVKgQvV6K8mRTW4j1bFG87h3gCW1yYXjj8KWmcgN1nmZpvmtpDNW5XwJNX2zz0FsVNXVCG4xNFmSW2YZzH_1rJKF2N1_t6DypQ3hFVW51m17GcGTm3kls1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgH1fW94sdfc7rVBMhW6HVCfx1FjKQGW9g_s2B3JSsYmW8hRlNR13TQwPW37zLJZ8LkMBVW55R7wT5MlR1mW9204FL9hbM1xW2tt16b61LS-fW452N4h6NnkwpN2lNKzKGFlNhW7Tl1KW54DQXKW4J191Y2sm0NKW7VKbFG6FKRvLVKgQvV6K8mRTW4j1bFG87h3gCW1yYXjj8KWmcgN1nmZpvmtpDNW5XwJNX2zz0FsVNXVCG4xNFmSW2YZzH_1rJKF2N1_t6DypQ3hFVW51m17GcGTm3kls1
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through May, the median single-family existing home price is up an astonishing 44.5% (Fig. 
11). 
  
This year's jump in mortgage rates only exacerbated the affordability problem facing would-
be first-time homebuyers, leaving many of them with no choice but to rent. That’s reflected 
by the jump in the Zillow Observed Rent Index, which was tracking around 3% y/y before 
the pandemic; it fell close to 0% in late 2020 and early 2021 before shooting up to peak at 
17.2% during February 2022 (Fig. 12). It declined slightly to 14.8% in June. 
  
(2) Rent measures. The CPI includes rent of primary residence and owners’ equivalent rent 
of primary residence (OER). The former measures tenant rents, while the OER measure 
imputes the rent that homeowners would have to pay to themselves if they were their own 
landlords. This strange concept makes sense since owner-occupied housing provides a 
service that is consumed every day, i.e., shelter. On the other hand, when rents go up, 
tenants have to pay more for rent, while nothing really changes for homeowners—unless 
higher rents are the result of higher home prices; in that case, they benefit. 
  
Tenant rent in the CPI is based on a sample of all existing leases, not based on new leases. 
New lease rents will show up in the CPI over the coming 12-24 months depending on the 
renewal terms of those leases. The Bureau of Labor Statistics uses statistical techniques to 
infer OER using rental prices for similar units in the area. As a result, the OER inflation rate 
tends to closely follow the tenant rent inflation rate (Fig. 13). 
  
(3) Rent inflation. Tenant rent inflation in the CPI rose from a 2021 low of 1.8% y/y during 
March through May to 5.8% during June of this year, the highest since July 1986. The OER 
measure rose to 5.5% during June, the highest since September 1990. 
  
Economist Larry Summers coauthored a February 2022 study titled “The Coming Rise In 
Residential Inflation.” It concluded that these rent inflation measures are likely to move 
close to 7% during 2022, and to remain high during 2023. The authors base that prediction 
on private-sector data on home prices and rents on new leases. They observe, “Historically, 
the year-over-year growth in home prices and market rents have been powerful leading 
indicators for OER inflation and [tenant] rent inflation [in the CPI].” 
  
(4) CPI vs PCED rents. The PCED and CPI inflation rates for tenant and OER rent are 
nearly identical (Fig. 14 and Fig. 15). However, they have higher weights in the CPI than in 
the PCED. 
  

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgBnNW5H8n6j5swtY7W2X_DFT3bck33VrjdJC4Prz1tW5LgS1W38Q8fLW3FHTh72Rn9gmW4bQYD715nRBkW3VcQ754nk6B2VKlj6s7ZhpDpW5msZ4r6SnqcMVgqdJs4cplb9Vrxcmg3DXB4xW57cXfP795GCTW4R6n186sPDgtW2Tv-kq6YyqyzW98Fqn66xgpvQW4BkVDM5TPBmTW4TR77m9cFymMW2zqH-p9c38c8W1fdQNb5rdwmtW3H4VSf5XJl-xW1HQnQP4yyb_fW8yY2Sz3sy5jj3jbv1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgBnNW5H8n6j5swtY7W2X_DFT3bck33VrjdJC4Prz1tW5LgS1W38Q8fLW3FHTh72Rn9gmW4bQYD715nRBkW3VcQ754nk6B2VKlj6s7ZhpDpW5msZ4r6SnqcMVgqdJs4cplb9Vrxcmg3DXB4xW57cXfP795GCTW4R6n186sPDgtW2Tv-kq6YyqyzW98Fqn66xgpvQW4BkVDM5TPBmTW4TR77m9cFymMW2zqH-p9c38c8W1fdQNb5rdwmtW3H4VSf5XJl-xW1HQnQP4yyb_fW8yY2Sz3sy5jj3jbv1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgBHZN5-HSVQXZ5NqN1FD7_cP2Py0W6vw3yQ5s_74-W3vhpFP8VmVpHW1LtYZC19BBhVW8tFYNF2HYg04W8X2KWj4G4m3RW6wVb9S3bT8lyW46R58-6zJQqPW22mrDd66T1nDW4F3bb61mrbmKW7XLWdY4k781KN43PpC6cDK9QW1wjC391TLHzdW4nKMBr3H-8KdW3Ltt8j51-prsW7XwdM82Nxz2VW6XQ2z1941BlmW7yK-S28SngL9W4Vb5bP35xlTyW5fPcmR6gC5W7N8K8rQZVJXNG35lf1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgLP_W648z1217xXkkW1hTNT482cG38W1qHyZt6NM7QhW24MRcH54YJgCN4FJhQnlDCZrW38bRYr3btfz_VD1JWj1qjGc_W1skLpy7lYmbxW1pXw582HF2F9W9kn8z-1lQDd0MvjkXnkhD27N8d-JJtStZZ-W7t0vSf8fSwF4W4KpHxF1JQvcvW3ndw6C4txSMZN8P4Sc2bj9BRVkfcPv1nRPtKW56xVtM1Mr-fNN7dFb96hMS96W36r87l8gHc6VW3lzXQW6qk8djN90TB1XcHXBp35f11
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV7L3q90pV1-WJV7CgTjvW4LbhtX3G95CLW5nNSZy4gsXwdW8TPyBT776rFXW3JGJZX8N-tkmW5QyztY3B4h5sW6YsFNm6JQ5x0W60czqS7XpWyZW6kLk0t3K_M6vW1QHLsP3H77YfW8S7g3D8XXBFFW1FL_yd7wBN-NN2v9Y0ftdFnWVwjp3l16yRTLW1xx7qY3MJbJWW7600RF4kTSzDW7qSD7m1n4XRYW2_T5Ls9f-sSWVFT6Rf2_CJx5W4J-dhR88mqMTW4bfkCS825ZBmW8JFtDG6rxMVNW4J8YCq97RFkLW1Jj0wb2m_32pVY6F7G5sfjKZW6Rl-7Z3d4M_jN981-LcQGLM524v1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgXZSW3kzLlj5y_HbnW3T4nFQ53dbTQW3LQMfX7F0TnMMBB-b_Xz9NFW6dgvKf7vJxKnW62HhQd51_3hxN9m4lxGtx9gVW4-j0c32ZNMw3W8ypsNC6xj9fVW12kYCQ8HZQQCW73FyQM5sdVHbW4ktSQT2LcbhxW5KyRKL9hDxKyMvxv6N1qWc7W7bkNmY44VXv8W1NxnG95PyhH8W2yHSlf344VBRW3nJCNS6D8hpjW8KD4_x3NNY41VRK79787f9C2W6N_4Wp7rnBFQN5yMV4gXk95y3dgn1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgMffVkgYpY2tR33-W3_VGvF5JSbLzW5dTgSt7PJfkzW18b23l4kHj3gW6GrHsX8xdBTfV8PkRS1hgmM4W4nxnMX6wyFRDN234wvNrqklXW3Hjwml5XB224W7Jgq-N7PTDgvW64FyN95wPkJ1W8_fHMx33xBzTW3xC7fd15wMw5W8C8KH-4M46x7W2CW5Mb4Wpg66W71PBtq3hQ6sJW992nX360L7RSW5cHCXm12lLCMW7t2vDK5h3X6ZN5xdtz37YbK9VS82W862FnzbW1Fv2W23bDmb13db31
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Rent of primary residence (a.k.a. tenant rent) and OER account for 7% and 24% of the 
headline CPI, 9% and 31% of the core CPI, and 12% and 40% of CPI services. So both 
together account for 31% of the headline CPI, 40% of the core CPI, and 52% of CPI 
services. 
  
Rent of primary residence and OER account for 4% and 11% of the headline PCED, 5% 
and 13% of the core PCED, and 6% and 17% of PCED services. So both together account 
for 15% of the headline PCED, 18% of the core PCED, and 23% of PCED services. 
  
As a result of the different weights, the Summers study concludes that “housing will make a 
significant contribution to overall inflation in 2022, ranging from one percentage point for 
headline PCED to 2.6 percentage points for core CPI.” 
  
That all makes sense to us. Nevertheless, we expect to see inflation rates moderating for 
both nondurable and durable goods during H2. So we are sticking with our forecast that the 
headline PCED inflation rate will ease from 6%-7% during H1-2022 to 4%-5% during H2-
2022 and get down to 3%-4% next year. Our inflation rate projections would be lower but for 
the upward pressure from the rent components of the consumer price measures. 
  
(5) Rents & wages. The risk for any optimistic outlook on inflation is that the wage-price-rent 
spiral continues to spiral. The CPI tenant rent component, on a y/y basis, closely tracks the 
WGT (Fig. 16). If inflation doesn’t cool off during the second half of this year, Fed Chair 
Jerome Powell may have no choice but to “go Volcker” and push interest rates up to 
whatever level it takes to cause a recession, as former Fed Chair Paul Volcker did during 
the 1970s. History shows that recessions do break the back of inflation. 

 

Calendars 
  
US: Tues: Housing Starts & Building Permits 1.585mu/1.650mu; API Weekly Crude Oil 
Inventories. Wed: Existing Home Sales 5.38mu; MBA Mortgage Applications; Crude Oil 
Inventories & Gasoline Production. (Bloomberg estimates) 
  
Global: Tues: Eurozone Headline & Core CPI 0.8%m/m/8.6%y/y & 0.2%m/m/3.7%y/y; UK 
Average Earnings Including & Excluding Bonus 6.9%/4.3%; UK Employment Change & 
Unemployment Rate 3m/3m 170k/3.8%; Bailey; Lowe. Wed: Eurozone Consumer 
Confidence -24.9; Germany PPI 1.3%m/m/33.9%y/y; UK Headline & Core CPI 

      
 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgFxmW32cLZB198W3GW3yk2CL8W5Bc1W2xvTs45MC565VBbC7F5y4R9jW7V0t3m5dtL4CW7R_0mQ2NCV47W7bwWJ-8ywpC5W4yTwYh57Fjr5W4PCYgF2xXwLgW8J_Pyb2f6hhyW6WtH1d99vxpHW54d_vN3YDwycW1XPhHP8ggBhlV4lJX-5_Q9VPW2SQN8M4tcS2JW24WgH06jQ9bnW7gq5G66r18PzW2rhCHm7_d6k8W5fkgvz8xHrNjW1ZBKmH1NCpvpW3Ksjtq3m5rgRW5nDp2W604MY03gKw1
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0.7%m/m/9.3%y/y & 0.5%m/m/5.8%y/y; UK PPI Input & Output 1.4%m/m/23.2%y/y & 
1.1%m/m/16.0%y/y; Canada Headline & Core CPI 8.4%/5.9% y/y; Japan Trade Balance – 
1.5t; Japan Exports & Imports 17.5%/45.7% y/y; Australia Quarterly Business Confidence; 
China New Loans; BOJ Interest Rate Decision -0.19%. (Bloomberg estimates) 

 

Strategy Indicators 
  
S&P 500/400/600 Forward Earnings (link): Forward earnings fell simultaneously for all 
three of these indexes last week for the first time since May 2020. None of these three 
indexes had forward earnings at a record high for a third straight week. LargeCap’s has 
fallen in four of the past 11 weeks and is now 0.2% below its record high at the end of June. 
MidCap’s has dropped in four of the past five weeks and is 0.8% below its record high in 
early June. SmallCap’s edged down 0.1% w/w to 2.7% below its record high in mid-June. In 
what was an extraordinary V-shaped recovery, LargeCap’s forward earnings has risen 
during 104 of the past 112 weeks, with the other down weeks due to Tesla’s addition to the 
index in December 2020, Amazon’s earnings misses for Q1-2022 and Q2-2021, Walmart’s 
Q1-2022 miss, and index changes last September and December. MidCap’s forward 
earnings is up in 103 of the past 110 weeks, and SmallCap’s posted 99 gains in the past 
111 weeks. SmallCap had been steadily making new highs each week until mid-December. 
Forward earnings for these indexes had been on an uptrend from November 2019 until 
February 2020, before tumbling to a bottom by June 2020 due to the Covid-19 economic 
shutdown. LargeCap’s forward earnings has risen 69.9% from its lowest level since August 
2017; MidCap’s is now up 139.5% from its lowest level since May 2015; and SmallCap’s 
has soared 196.4% from its lowest point since August 2013. In the latest week, the rate of 
change in LargeCap’s forward earnings fell to a 15-month low of 17.3% y/y from 18.0%; 
that’s down from a record-high 42.2% at the end of July 2021 and up from -19.3% in May 
2020, which was the lowest since October 2009. The yearly rate of change in MidCap’s 
forward earnings dropped w/w to a 15-month low of 29.1% y/y from 30.3%. That’s down 
from a record high of 78.8% at the end of May and compares to a record low of -32.7% in 
May 2020. SmallCap’s rate fell to a 16-month low of 27.5% y/y from 28.4%. It’s down from a 
record high of 124.2% in June 2021 and up from a record low of -41.5% in June 2020. 
Companies have been beating consensus estimates quite handily since the Q2-2020 
earnings season, causing analysts’ consensus earnings forecasts for 2021 to 2023 to 
improve instead of decline as is typical, but their forecasts are likely to head lower now. 
Here are the latest consensus earnings growth rates for 2022 and 2023: LargeCap (9.7%, 
9.1%), MidCap (13.9, 6.1), and SmallCap (10.5, 11.4). 

      
 

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgZgbW3l72s91kl93GW5Q-jjj62ySXWW6w3cFZ11Tc81N69mfgs54M3fW8JqHT27gg_vbW75lMCt6230-hW6SNzCp6gKP9wW6fSw2K89nxWHN3618BvT1P3pW5XHYr-77mJyxW8Q2GJ25fvjlHW4pbrwZ5wFRYWVjGCqp1SxJzhW26hMb57VydkNVcrJM042VnXLW2rzmb52mxd3mW3gcN0K7H_bVVW4cqG2t3RlBFzN96FyHQ2WW-CN8dYQ1n8_9K6W5KCkK64XQNqZW2SVlXk8lg2dm37pS1
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S&P 500/400/600 Valuation (link): Valuations ticked down for these three indexes last 
week. LargeCap’s forward P/E dropped 0.2pts to 16.1 from 16.3 a week earlier, but is up 
from a 26-month low of 15.3 in mid-June. It’s down from a six-month high of 21.5 in early 
November. LargeCap’s forward P/E also compares to a 19-year high of 22.7 in January 
2021 and is up from 13.3 in March 2020, which was the lowest since March 2013. MidCap’s 
fell 0.1pt to 11.6 from 11.7, but is up from a 27-month low of 11.1 in mid-June. That’s down 
from a 13-week high of 17.1 in early November. It had been at a record high of 22.9 in June 
2020 and an 11-year low of 10.7 in March 2020. SmallCap’s also dropped 0.1pt, to 11.4 
from 11.5 a week earlier. Its mid-June reading of 10.7 was the lowest since it bottomed at a 
record low of 10.2 in November 2009 during the Great Financial Crisis. That compares a 
13-week high of 16.1 in early November and its record high of 26.7 in early June 2020 when 
forward earnings was depressed. LargeCap’s forward P/E in February 2020—before Covid-
19 decimated forward earnings—was 18.9, the highest level since June 2002. Of course, 
that high was still well below the tech-bubble record high of 25.7 in July 1999. Last week’s 
level compares to the post-Lehman-meltdown P/E of 9.3 in October 2008. MidCap’s P/E 
was below LargeCap’s P/E yet again last week, as it has been for most of the time since 
August 2018. In contrast, it was last solidly above LargeCap’s from April 2009 to August 
2017; MidCap’s current 28% discount to LargeCap is near its biggest since September 
2000. SmallCap’s P/E was below LargeCap’s for a 100th straight week. That’s the longest 
stretch at a discount since 1999-2002; SmallCap’s current 29% reading is near its biggest 
discount since February 2001. SmallCap’s P/E had been mostly above LargeCap’s since 
2003. Looking at SmallCap’s P/E relative to MidCap’s, it was at a discount for a 57th 
straight week; the current 2% discount is up from a 9% discount in December but remains 
near its lows during 2000-01. 

S&P 500 Sectors Quarterly Earnings Outlook (link): Since the Q3-2020 earnings season, 
analysts as a whole have been raising their consensus forecasts for future quarters instead 
of lowering them as is the norm through the earnings warnings seasons. That six-quarter 
streak of positive revisions throughout the quarter officially ended with Q1-2022. In the 
latest week, the Q2-2022 earnings-per-share forecast fell 40 cents w/w to $55.11, and is 
now down 1.4% from its $55.92 forecast at the start of the quarter. Analysts expect S&P 
500 earnings growth to weaken substantially to 4.5% y/y on a frozen actual basis and 5.6% 
on a pro forma basis. That’s down from Q1-2022’s 11.6% y/y on a frozen actual basis and 
an 11.4% y/y gain on a pro forma basis. Double-digit growth is expected for just three 
sectors in Q2-2022, and five are expected to record a y/y decline. That compares to Q1-
2022’s count of seven sectors with double-digit growth, one with a single-digit gain, and 
three with a y/y decline. Here are the S&P 500 sectors’ latest earnings growth rates for Q2-
2022 versus their Q1-2022 growth rates: Energy (248.8% in Q2-2022 versus 269.5% in Q1-

https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV773q8_QV1-WJV7CgPGSW4m7lDn5VFQZrW3_VrLr6rgmZWW1xzQqm7jgKl6W8R5nd325GthGW2366142JYXvgW3p59NS5zxZ5-N48nC072jG7lW1bxSV093KgHFW2VXjgl9dSpzcW4TZQXF6pDsgyN23QyH8xvd38W5-yVTC63cq9hN17-6NkNDScQW7qZSYs7kWjP3N6xJY4k1NQNsW15DKxM1gtBfDW6k1XcJ8gQ8CvW3yq6ss7SFCCbW19qhgF8WyH40MNYLggtLt6bW4Bygc64SSf6YW5Sdnns3tkKHy3flT1
https://d13h9q04.na1.hubspotlinks.com/Ctc/5E+113/d13h9Q04/VWX6QN4R9lQyW1R1fpn2z4KllW67tPB74MG5jDN3wqV7r3q905V1-WJV7Cg-DXW93Fckw4t0JwrW9dkTG24WDs5ZW3980Zm4hTfbLW2WHHHY7v8XX3W8vtQFv65ytTgW1c8Ysk9ldyGtW77tPlP4VbWYwW1Sm7lk23rsVcN90fs9jTCrBYW2Mnkbn5TKd7KW7dbLc17RwCQBW2ZGykV8vQhM0W3F46Lw47HycWN60VC2Nx_xszW6Hnd1-5_X76JW4FqCdf8Xp9rWVNbk5n6Rc2xvW90LZj53Y1g3MW8snlWK4gs8j0W4WPMGX5r4lw9W6mtGD16s0bzdW2Nzrkw73-0lgW3T1r_T4JmNcWW81dyCH87_cV-3qfM1
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2022), Industrials (26.7, 40.5), Materials (16.2, 46.3), S&P 500 (5.6, 11.4), Real Estate (3.9, 
25.5), Health Care (2.1, 18.3), Information Technology (2.4, 14.6), Consumer Staples (-1.0, 
7.9), Consumer Discretionary (-6.2, -27.9), Utilities (-12.4, 24.6), Communication Services (-
14.9, -2.8), and Financials (-21.1, -17.1). 
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